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SGA Being Vacated by Departing Members
Pat Patterson, SGA President,

and Beverly Osborne, Vice
President, will be leaving CJC at

the end of this quarter.
Patterson is leaving because as

he states “They’re offering three
courses at Mercer next quarter
that I’ve got to have for my
major. If 1 don’t get them next

quarter 1 have to wait two years.”
Osborne is leaving because of

graduation.
These actions will result in the

executive branch of the Student
Government being vacated. The
executive branch initiates most of
the action taken by the SGA.

The normal procedure for

filling the vacancy of the office of
SGA President is for the Vice
President to succeed that office.
There will, however, be no Vice
President.

According to Patterson, a

series of steps has been planned to

overcome this difficulty.
The first step will be

Patterson’s resignation before the
end of the quarter, resulting in
the presidency being filled by
Osborne for the remainder. At
this time the SGA Senate will
elect one of its members to the

post of Vice President, as is

provided in the Student
Government Constitution.
Osborne will then resign, leaving
the office of President to

whomever the senators have
chosen as Vice President. The
Senate will then again choose a

member to serve as Vice
President. These two will hold the
office of President and Vice
President in an interim capacity
until the elections in the spring
quarter are held to fill these
offices.

Gary Jester, Senator from the
Math-Science Division, will also
be leaving at the end of this
quarter if plans work out for him.
Since becoming a Senator for the
Student Government Association,
Jester has served on the Student
Affairs Committee, the General
Entertainment Committee, the
L y ce u m/C u 11 ur a 1 Affairs

Committee, and the Intramurals
Committee.

Patterson plans to go to

Mercer University, Osborne to

West Georgia College, and Jester

Tablet

Succaaalul

Oaspita
Criticiam
Despite recent criticisms levied

against it, the Clay Tablet, the
school’s literary magazine, is

enjoying success among Clayton
students.

According to William Daily Jr.
the magazine’s editor, “It’s going
good and people are picking it

up.”
Appearing in a recent issue of

the Bent Tree, a review of the

Clay Tablet written by D.W.
Plunkett was highly critical of the
current issue.

Daily reports, however, that
this criticism has had little effect
on the response to the magazine
and that at the time of this
writing he and his staff have
assimilated and distributed over

500 issues, all of which have been

picked up by Clayton students.
Daily announced new

additions to the Clay Tablet staff:
Helen McNair, Public Relations
Director; Margaret Conolly,
Poetry Editor; and Dan Evatt,
Staff photographer.

- Clint Danbury

is planning to go to Georgia Tech.
Of importance now is the

election to be held in the Spring
Quarter. The race for President
will be highly contested and
Patterson made mention of the
fact that “There’s going to be so

many people running.”
The reason for this

enthusiasm, according to

Patterson, is that “It’s such a

tremendously competitive
office.” He pointed out that the
President has the power to

appoint the student members of
all the s t u d e n t-f ac u 11 y
committees. Although the
President must have the approval
of the Senate, no Senate in the

past few years has failed to give
confirmation of a presidential
appointee.

Asked about the present set

up of the SGA, Patterson
remarked “There aren’t any

(flaws in the system), it’s perfect.
It’s the most perfect system in the

University System of Georgia. I
can’t conceive of a better

system.” said Patterson.
He did mention, though, that

“the filing system is broken
down. There’s garbage laying
around.”

Aside from these minor
difficulties Patterson said that at

the present his “main concern is
for the publicity of the elections.

Dean Bolander Calls

for End of Senate

I’d like to see about 1200 turnout,
for the election.”

Although less than 350
students turned out for the last
SGA election, Patterson says that
the 1200 figure is “a conservative
estimate.”

The Senate itself will also be
losing a considerable number of
its members.

Patterson said that “a lot of
people will be running for the
senate and there will be no

vacancies after the election.”
In the past, candidates have

been restricted in their
advertising. The only place where
candidates were allowed to put up
posters was the window area of

the Student Lounge in the]
bottom floor of the Library.
When asked whether or not this ;

practice would continue this

spring in the elections, Patterson.
remarked, “That’s up to the
elections committee.’’ As_
mentioned earlier, the SGA
President has the power to.,
appoint the student members to

committees such as the elections,
committee.

He did say, though, that he_
would like to see posters of
candidates in various locations
across campus. “If they’re in good
taste.”

- Clint Danbury

*************************^****AA*1**
February 23 Studenf Recital Noon GlOl .

Intramural Wrestling Sign-up

February 24 Intramural Wrestling Sign-up

February 28 EARLY REGISTRATION - SPRING QUARTER

March 1 EARLY REGISTRATION - SPRING QUARTER
Student Recital 7:00 p.m. G132

March 2 Student Recital Noon G132

March 3 “20th Century Art & Music” 10:00 a.m. G132

March 4 Movie 1:15,7:30,9:50
“The Return of the Pink Panther” G132

Kiddie Film 7:30 p.m. GlOl

March 8 CLEP Test 2:00 & 6:00 p.m .B-15

Wordmonger Walton

Gets Ideas Across

Dean of Students Robert
Bolander startled the February 10
Student Government Association

meeting with the suggestion to

desolve the SGA. The Senate was

quick to pass a resolution to

study his proposal with the aim of

acting before this quarter’s end.
The general Senate reaction was

favorable to the proposal.
The Senate meeting opened by

discussing Senate matters when as

a last order of business Vice
President Osborne gave Dean

Bolander the floor. He

immediately called for the end of
the SGA Senate and termed the

college’s decision to put students
on administrative committees a

mistake. “If they (the students)
had fought for it (committee
representation) they would enjoy
it,” he said. Bolander qualified his
remarks by noting that at present
student participation on

committees is poor.
Few students have time

beyond the class room to

participate in college activities he
said. “The SGA spends a lot of
energy and effort in duplication.
This energy should be spent on

the committees; that is where the
influence is.”

Clarifying his position Dean
Bolander suggested the SGA
retain the offices of President,
Vice President, Treasurer, and
Secretary, but abolish the Senate.
Students would be appointed to

committee positions by the
Student Affairs Committee.
The Senate received

Bolander’s proposals favorably;
however Vice President Osborne
dissented stating “The Senate is a

mediator between faculty and
students. Students can bring their

complaints to the SGA.”
Dean Bolander responded

saying the S t^d ent Affairs
Committee could handle this

responsibility.
John Feathers, faculty sponsor

of the SGA, voiced his agreement
with the Dean. “I’m not

suggesting we do away with
student representation, but let us

look at what is functioning and
use it.”
Senator Carol Reeves

motioned the SGA obtain a

general concensus of the student

body before acting, but the
motion was quickly modified to
set up an ad hoc committee to

study Dean Bolander’s suggestions
and make a report. John Rhea
added a call for the Senate to act

before the quarter’s end. The

motion was passed unanimously.
The majority of the SGA

members spoke in favor of
abolishing the Senate with the
notable exceptions of President
Pat Patterson and Vice President

Beverly Osborne.
- David Plunkett

The lecture of Charlie Walton
on Tuesday, February 8, 1977,
which was sponsored by the
Lyceum turned out to be

delightful and amusing. Mr.
Walton is a gentleman that found
his talent early in life and has

successfully learned how to use it
to earn an excellent living.

Walton has a B.A. Degree in

Elementary Education from
David Lipscomb College and a

M.A. Degree in the Education of
the Deaf from George Peabody
College. His background is
education but his talent is
communication. “Getting ideas
across” is the thing he does best.
He claims that “not being an

expert” helps his career. “Often a

client of mine will know his

subject too well to explain it to

the uninitiated. I am in a position
to ask the questions that the

uninitiated would ask,” stated
Walton

Mr. Walton started out his
career by teaching. He stated that
he “liked teaching but didn’t like
the kids.”

For someone who professes
not to like children, a great deal
of his work is for and about
children. One of his creations is a

fictional character known as

“George Library”, who cleverly
introduces children to card
catalogs.

At the present, he is working
with a project in Clayton County.
This program is designed to assist

handicapped children back into a

normal class room setting thus

easing them into the mainstream
of life.

One of the more interesting
areas of Walton’s career is the
time he and his wife spent in New

Zealand. Early in their marriage
the Waltons decided that they
would go to New Zealand and
work for the Church of Christ as

missionaries. While in New
Zealand, Walton was responsible
for publications, advertising,
organization and direction of
summer camps, and an extensive

program of public relations and

evangelism.
Some suggestions given by Mr.

Walton to the students attending
the lecture were “when writing
your term pepers keep the

professor in mind and give them a

break ... try not to bore them.
Also understanding your audience
is a critical point in putting your
ideas across. Try to verbally grab
someone by the shirt.” He also
said that “whatever you choose to

do, somewhere along your career

you will have to be a writer.
- Mary Jane Warner
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"Someone should give us a kick."

Bent Tree An

Camelot

TIckata

Avallabla

Opinion Rag??!!
Someone, I think it was Bent

Tree advisor Jean Graham, was

arguing with me over whether or

not The Bent Tree was becoming
an opinion rag. She said no; I said

yes. This should convert her.

I’ve been trying to come up

with some simple form letters to

request Presidential Pardons.

Here’s one: Dear Mr. President,
Please pardon me. At present I am

serving time in a Veterans hospital
for having answered the Draft.

Signed ....
Investing in the student senate

may be a poor risk if Dean

Bolander has his way. He wants to

end the one unified body of

student opinion on campus. The

worst of it is the senate wants him

to do it also. Maybe it’s rubber

stamp syndrome.
Black History Week just

passed with nary a peck of the

typewriter from the school

newspaper. Personally I’m

ashamed we failed to get any

coverage, but I also think it’s

important to note I can not

remember any black reporter on

the staff during the last four

quarters. I don’t think we need a

black reporter to cover events

such as Black History Week, but
we do need somebody to kick us

when we forget to cover all

college activities.
You know it’s rumor or I

wouldn’t be spreading it. I’ve

caught wind of a plan to change
the role of faculty advisors to the

Clay Tablet and The Bent Tree

making them instructors. If you

think the publications are

censored now, wait till instructors

start grading them before you

read them.
1 once said I wouldn’t put an

opinion in the Tree until I had a

good one, and until I get one

you’re just going to have to read

the facts. Now, anyone for

politics?
- D.W, Plunkett

The 5enT Tree
editor

(ilozier

Associate editor l>avid W Plunkett

P.igc editors ...

('lint Danbury
Debra Peterson

Mary Jane Warner

Distribution fiditor Kathy Allen

t^iusie Jimmy Montjoy
Kenneth Wirth

. Photographers (.rady Anderson

') ...

Dan e.vatt

j General Keporters Views espressed in l lie Hent free .ire those ot

i \iark 11 liston 1 he Bciil free statV or its contributors and arc

eslelle l.ong not necessarily iliosc of the administration,

i f arol Reeves faculty, oi sludeiil body of Clayton Junior
’ College, file Hent I ree is published hi weekly

¡ and produced eniirely un the C’iayKtn .lunior

College campus midei i!ic direction ol JJieJicm
! Jree staff and Its editors.

Ken Pollock (right): There are links between pornography and sex crimes.

Glenn Zell (left): Is there legitimate state interest?

Reserved seat tickets for

“Camelot”, a four-night
presentation scheduled at CJC
March 9-12, are available. To be

given by the CJC Choir and

Orchestra, all performances of the
Lerner and Lowe presentation
will be free and open to the

public. However, all seats will be

reserved and must be obtained in

advance, according to Dr. Larry
Corse, Choir Director.

Performances are scheduled at

8:30 p.m. on Wednesday and

Thursday, March 9 and 10, and

beginning at 8 p.m. on Friday and

Saturday, March 11 and 12. In

addition, an open dress rehearsal
will be given at 12 noon on

Wednesday.
Free tickets may be obtained

from the secretary in the Division

of Humanities between the hours

of 9 a.m. and 8 p.m. Monday
through Thursday, and 9 a.m.

until 5 p.m. on Friday.

All students graduating in

June 1977 please check with the

Bookstore to order your caps and

“HORRID” - A key character in the March 9-12 presentation of gowns. The Bookstore will be-

“Camelot” at CJC will be this wooly character named “Kabooby” who will taking orders beginning March 1,

play “Horrid” in the Lerner and Lowe presentation. Currently involved in through April 1, 1977.
intensive training with CJC choir Director Dr. Larry Corse and his wife,
Sandra, Horrid, or Kabooby , is owned by Tanya Peacock of Morrow.

Winiam E. "Pete" Frey presides at hearing.

Lyceum Presentation

FT'rrdoiri

In search of an answer to how

much freedom os expression is

protected by the constitution, the
Lyceum presented “Freedom of

Expression on Trial”, Wednesday
February 9. Since no vote was

taken, neither side, in what was

largely a pornography trial, could
claim victory.

Ken Pollock, a former

Assistant Solicitor from Fulton

County, prosecuted for the law

saying, “It is erroneous to say the

State of Georgia has gone too far

to prohibit pornography.” He

noted, in his opening argument,
the nation has never accepted
total freedom of expression and

further, citing examples, it is not

a conservative vs. liberal issue.
In defense of more open

freedom of expression Atlanta

attorney Glenn Zell stated,
“Placing a limit to freedom of

.1/xpression

expression is an inherently
dangerous doctorine.” He pointed
out the play HAIR has never been

produced in Georgia because of

fear of prosecution and said, “It is
bad to have a law which can have
this kind of inroad on your
freedom.”

The prosecution next

presented its expert witness.
Director of the Emory University
Center for Research in Social

Change, Dr. Fred Crawford. He

stated there were linkages
between sex crimes and

pornography and cited several

examples.
The defense called Psycologist

Dr. J. Frank Clark who
contradicted Dr. Crawford’s

position. “Sex crimes are

committed by deranged
individuals. Sexually explicit
movies do not cause sex crimes.”

Prosecutor Pollock summing
up his argument said the present
obscenity laws are not too broad
or vague. “We have a living
constitution. Juries decide if
material is obscene by community
standards. The law therefore

changes with the community.”
The defense responded that

there is no such thing as a

common community standard.
“You are dealing with people of
different moral standards.”

Clayton County Solicitor
William E. Frey acting as judge
asked each side to explain where

they thought the obscenity law
will go. The prosecution forsaw
no significant changes in the law

while the defense felt a mote

liberal Supreme Court will make
changes during the 1980’s.

The Lyceum presentation can

be heard on cassette tape in the

library.
- David Plunkett
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REGISTRATION INFORMATION

EARLY ADVISEMENT FEBRUARY 21-25, 1977
Faculty Offices (see Advisement Information in this schedule)

Undeclared Advisement

Day February 22-23

•Evening February 22-23
Declared Advisement

Day February 21-25 9:00 a.m. - 2:00 p.m.

•Evening February 22-23 5:30 p.m. - 8:30 p.m.

9:00 a.m. - 2:00 p.m.
5:30 p.m. - 8:30 p.m.

All students enrolled Fall and/or Winter, 1977 are urged to take advantage
of early advisement regardless of early registration plans. Only those
students enrolled Fall and/or Winter are eligible to register
early. * Evening students should plan to be advised on the night that
they are not in classes.

Advisement Sheets are available February 21-25 in the Office of the

Registrar (8:00 a.m.- 5:00 p.m.). Advisement Sheets for evening students
whose last names begin with A-G will be in G-110; students whose names

begin with H-O in G-210; P-Z, C-19 (5:30 p.m.-8:30 p.m.).

EARLY REGISTRATION FEB. 28 & MARCH 1,1977

February 28 10:00 a.m.

Times
- 2:00 p.m. Students with 30+ hours

5:30 p.m. -8:30 p.m. All Students
March 1 10:00 a.m. - 2:00 p.m. All Students

5:30 p.m. - 8:30 p.m. All Students

(These hours are as of Fall Quarter, 1976)
PLACE: After completing a Course Schedule Form with his advisor (or
self-advising) a student proceeds to the Division or Department Office
where he wishes to enroll in a course (i.e. Special Studies, G-216; Health
Sciences, C-33; Humanities, G-205; Natural Sciences & Mathematics, C-33;
Business, C-15 and Social Sciences, G-110A). A course card is obtained for
each course for which a student wishes to register. The student takes these

course cards to the Office of the Registrar where registration materials and
course cards are merged. Course cards issued on February 28 and March 1

are valid for Early Registration only. Having turned all cards in to the

Registrar's Office, the student may pay his fees at the Business Office or

may delay payment as outlined below.

Fees are payable as follows:
(1) Payable on Early Registration days (February 28 and March 1).
(2) Payable in the Business Office on or before March 15. (Business Office

hours: 8 a.m. - 5 p.m., Monday through Friday.)
(3) Payable by check or money order at the Reception Desk,

Administration Building on or before March 15 (5 p.m. - 9 p.m.,
Monday through Thursday).

For students wishing to pay by mail, a check or money order must be

received in the Business Office no later than March 15. Validated ID
cards may be obtained at the Reception Desk, Administration Bui|illng,
beginning March 25, 1977.

ID and Fee cards must accompany fee payments .

If you fail to complete the registration process by March 15, you may
enroll in courses for the Spring Quarter by registering on March 29 (after
regular registration) in the Office of the Registrar (11 a.m.- 2 p.m. or 5:30

p.m.- 8:30 p.m.). Failure to pay fees by March 15 Is failure to complete the
registration process; the master cards and course cards used at Early
Registration are not valid after March 15.
REMINDER: Turn course cards in February 28 or March 1.

REGULAR ADVISEMENT AND REGISTRATION

MARCH 24, 1977
FORMER STUDENTS
Advisement: Faculty Offices (See Advisement Information in this

schedule)
9:30 a.m. - 11:30 a.m., 5:30 p.m. - 8:30 p.m.

Registration: Lobby, Academic Building (C Bldg.)
10:00 a.m. - 2:00 p.m.
5:30 p.m, - 8:30 p.m.

Time preference will be given to students who have earned the most hours.
(A readmitted student must present the permanent record copy received
with his readmission letter.)

NEW STUDENTS:
Advisement: Room G-132 (New Classroom Bldg.)

10:00 a.m, or 6:00 p.m.
A general Information session is scheduled for new students at the times
listed. Information on faculty advisors and scheduling wilt be available.

Registration permits will be distributed.
Registration: Lobby, Academic Building (C Bldg.)

After being advised, a student will be admitted to registration upon

presenting his registration permit. Time preference will be given to

returning students.

Fees must be paid at the time of registration.

lere courçeç wiiBufineîs Career Majorç tíií

offered Spring ^^tr.
eMGT 26 , I ntro to Cinance
6MGT 271 Mone 4 G Banking

Bf^G'X 2Ç2 Intermediate /Gccou nting
time? to ke announceed

.BMGT 2Ô1 M arketing 0:25 pm Tu Tki

ke i

WANT
ADS

General Warehouse person wanted
by Zayre’s Distribution Center,
Forest Park, Ga. Hours:

4:00-8:00 p.m. $3.50/hr. Call
363-3912.

Compiler (computer) needed at

Diversified Discount Systems,
Lake Harbin Road. Hours:
5:00-8:00 p.m. $3.00/hr. Call
John Dunn 961-5400.

Night Auditor for Safari Inn,
Stockbridge, Ga. Hours: 11 p.m.-
7 a.m, $2.70-2.75/hr. Call Mr.

Murphy 474-1271.

CÜC Class

Visits

Nssly
Reactor

The Neely Nuclear Research
Center on the campus of the

Georgia Institute of Technology
was visited by Dr. Miriam Perry’s
Environmental Science class last

month. The class is studying
about Nuclear energy and the visit

coincided with the recent

fuel-shortage scare. With the

possibility of Nuclear power being
our main source of energy for the
immediate future, interest among
students was very high. Mr, Bob

Kirkland, who is the Research
Reactor Supervisor, guided the

tour and answered the students’

questions.
The major use of reactors is

the production of power. Heat

produced in the fission process
may be used just as is heat
obtained by burning coal or oil to
convert water to steam, which is

in turn used to generate
electricity. In the Georgia Tech
reactor no use will be made of the
heat produced. The Tech reactor

is used mostly for training
purposes. Much of the staff that
mans the Nuclear Power Plant in

Baxley, Ga. was trained on the
Tech Reactor. Students at the

Institute also utilize the facility
for training purposes.

In answer to the question
whether or not the reactor could

blow up like an atomic bomb, Mr.
Kirkland said that the Reactor

was designed taking into
consideration the most

“catastrophic” of events. He went
on to explain that the type of fuel
and principles of design of a

reactor are quite different from
those of a bomb and that the

Tech reactor is in no way capable
of an atomic explosion.

The money to operate the

reactor is government-funded and

thereby it is owned by the

tax-payers. It is not a ‘secret

place’ and any groups or

individuals that might have need
of the services of the reactor can

utilize it by going through the

proper channels.
Mr. Bob Boyd, in charge of

monitoring radioactivity safety,
gave a brief ‘off-the cuff outline
of how the monitoring is done.
He showed several technological
devices that are used to check the
air around the plant itself and in

strategic locations surrounding
the Atlanta area. These
instruments determine whether or
not radioactivity in a person or in
the environment exceeds the

safety limits. The only people
really in danger of over-exposure
are the actual operators of the
reactor and they are carefully
monitored.

Dr. Robert Moore of the
Environmental Protection Agency
further explained his purpose
with the Nuclear Research Center.
He analyses all parts of the
environment to determine what
elements are present and measures

them. He stated, “There is a lot of

ambiguity in many of the reports
circulating on just what is
considered toxic and what isn’t in
the atmosphere, and this should
be taken into consideration when

reading anything published on the

subject.”
The current operating cost of

the Neely Reactor is in the area of

a quarter of a million dollars,
most of that cost being in

personnel. The center was initially
financed by the State of Georgia,
The National Science Foundation,
and the Atomic Energy
Commission at a total cost of
$4.5 million dollars.

Anyone interested in touring
the Tech Reactor should call
894-3600.

- Mary Jane Warner

Dr. Patrick Collins

Dr. Patrick Collins, English
professor at CJC is a very unusual

man, as anyone who has attended
his class will attest. Not only is his

teaching style unique, his

personality is also unique.
How often does a man marry a

woman with six young children?
Dr. Collins did just that. Six
months after his marriage, he and
his wife adopted a battered child
as well,

Ellouise, his wife, is an

extraordinary woman. She holds a

Ph.D. and is director of

STRETCH, a program for

Training Regular Educators to

Teach Children With Handicaps.
Dr. Collins has been at CJC for

three years. He spent an entire

summer on 1-75 moving from
Ohio to Walden III, a beautiful
old home he and his wife had
restored in Pike County. One

month after moving the last load
of furniture from Ohio, Walden
III burned to the ground,
destroying everything they
owned. Among their losses was

his collection of 3,000 books and
records and all the poetry and

writings he had done over the

years. With typical wit he says

Spotlight
on

Dr Collins

that this was the only time he
ever cried in the classroom.

They rebuilt their home on

the six acres of land where they
garden and raise a menagerie of
animals including five horses and
a pen full of chickens. Dr. Collins
can sometimes be seen riding
around with his four huge dogs,
all gifts from students, in a small

Toyota Corolla.
His love for literature is

apparent in his teaching but he

says he is more ‘person’ oriented
than he used to be. His students
feel free to go to him any time for
help, in their personal lives as well
as in their scholastic work. He has
affectionately been called the
“Silver Fox” by them. He never

has a dull class becuase of his
fantastic sense of humor. His
philosophy of life is “We all take
ourselves too seriously and our

lives not seriously enough”.
Dr. Collins graduated from

Stonehill College with a Bachelor

of Arts degree in 1953. In 1959
he received his Masters from

Fordham University and his

doctorate at Bowling Green State

University in 1973.
- Estelle Long

Tortoise Ties Hare

at Auto Club Rallye
The CJC Auto Club held its

first ralleye of the Spring season

on Sunday, February 13th. The

rallyists had to follow a series of
59 directions that had them

crisscrossing Clayton, Henry and

Fayette counties for an hour and
a half. The result was a classis
contest between the tortoise and

the hare. The tortoise was a

lumbering old 68 VW van manned

by Russ Key and David Morgan,
the club’s faculty advisor. The

hare was a tiny and quick
Triumph Spitfire piloted by Mark

Lunsford and Jay Pfeiffer.
The Spitfire jumped off to a

quick advantage only to miss a

turn. The VW Van plodding
steadily along took the lead. The
hare recovered and passed the

tortoise but soon it had to stop
for brake fluid. The tortoise was

back in the lead. With brakes

working again, the Spitfire
rejoined the pursuit, finally
catching the VW Van shortly
before the finish.

However, Rallymaster Jim

Gray declared the race a tie. He

said the hare had a quicker time
but the tortoise has more accurate

elapsed mileage.
Others participating in the

ralleye were Ed Pritchard and Ed

Butcher in a superfast dunebuggy.
They were so fast they ran off
course and ended up in Peachtree
City before finding their way

back to the finish.
Starting second in a Pinto

were Wanda and Wayne Smith,
They got lost before the first

checkpoint but with help from
their CB radio made it to the post
rally party.

Then there was the purple
'

TR6 of Mark Berrie and
Katherine Gray. They haven’t
been heard from since they were

last seen heading the wrong way
down a dirt road near Southlake
Mall.

Finally, Kathy Lunsford and
John Boromolini were in
contention in their Camaro until

they drove past the last

checkpoint without stopping.
To Mark and Katherine,

wherever you are; our next rally
will be Sunday, February 27th at

1:30 p.m. in the Administration

Building parking lot.
An auto ralleye is something

like a treasure hunt. No special
skills are needed. One person
drives while the other reads the
directions. The objective is to get
from the start to the finish

without making any mistakes.

Penalty points are assessed for

driving too quickly or too slowly
or for driving too far or not far

enough. For more details on auto

ralleying, stop by the Counseling!
Center, C-61, and talk with David'

Morgan.
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JlíBum
"Rumors” Spread
by Fleetwood Mac

(Fleetwood Mac Rumors J If you were turned on by
previous Fleetwood Mac music - you’ll love this one. It is hot off the press
and it’s a KILLER. Fleetwood Mac has an abundance of talent; especially
in the writing and singing departments - in fact, they almost have too

much talent for one group. I think that at least three members of the group
could make it on their own.

Now; back to the album. The lead vocal duties were divided fairly
equally, but 1 think people would like to hear more of Stevie Nicks Most of
the melodies and song topics pattern their previous album, but don’t get
me wrong, all of the material on Rumors is quality material. Mac pride
themselves in producing quality albums; this is the first album they’ve
made in almost a year (some were wondering if there was ever going to be

another one). The song entitled “You Can Go Your Own Way” has been

released as a single, and it is the highlight of the album. Rumors is worthy
of your ears.

• - Sam Huston

PETERSON’S PALATE

Recipes In
The Making

Last issue I invited'the students and faculty to send in their favorite

recipes. The response thus far has given me six recipes for this issue. I’m

hoping for as great response for the next issue also. If all goes according to

plan. I’ll be starting a new column that will print the recipes I receive

during the week separate from Peterson’s Palate.

Starting next issue, in Peterson’s Palate I’ll be reviewing one particular
restaurant rather than collectively as I’ve done in the past. 1 hope you’ll be

patient with me as I try to be as objective as 1 can. This is something very

new to me and with time I hope I’ll be able to write the reviews with more

ease and confidence. See you next week.
Debra Peterson

>:i^ED SPAGHETTI
... Rob Taylor

One Batch cf spaghetti - preferably Vermicelli (12 oz. uncooked)
4 cups paghetti sauce - (Homemade or premixed) with meat,

mushrooms, or plain - ycuTíiioice

Combine coo'^ed spahetti and sauce. Pour into a 12 x8 (or similar

size) glass pan. t! over with grated Mozzarella Cheese and bake at 350

degrees for 20 min 'tes. Serve with additional sauce and Parmesan Cheese.

(A bit of oregano an,'/or garlic salt will be appreciated.)

ITALIAN CRESCENTS
.... Rob Taylor

1 package Pillsbury Crescent Rolls %
Softened butter

Oregano
Parnesan Cheese
Garlic Salt

Unroll and separate the crescents and spread lightly with softened

butter. Sprinkle oregano, parmesan cheese and garlic salt on buttered

pieces. Roll up and bake according to instructions on package.
Optional extra - Put a few pieces of shredded mozzarella cheese in each

crescent.
Serves 4 — 2 per person.

WATERGATE SALAD
. . . .Secretaries from the Dean of Students Office

1 box Instant Pistachio Pudding
10 oz. container of ‘Cool Whip’
15 oz. can drained crushed pineapple
1 cup chopped pecans
1 cup miniature marshmallows (colored)

Empty box of pudding into large mixing bowl. Add all other

ingrediants. Stir thoroughly and chill. Ready to eat when chilled.

CHOCOLATE CAKE

2 cups sugar
2 cups flour
pinch of salt
3/4 cup cocoa

1 teaspoon baking soda

.... Dr.David Morgan
2 eggs
1 cup milk
1/2 cup cooking oil
1 teaspoon vanilla
2 teaspoons baking powder
1 cup hot coffee - to be added last

Mix all ingredients and pour into sheet cake pan (greased and floured).
Bake at 325 degrees for 3540 minutes.

Sports
Intramural Standings
as of Feb. 15, 1977

Huns 72 points
Tribunes 61 points
Vandals 53 points
Knights 47 points

Basketball Results

1st - Huns
2nd - Knights
3rd - Tribunes
4th - Vandals

Harvill
Reports
Light
Turnout

Dr. Avery Harvill. Director of
Physical Education and

intramurals, is somewhat

disappointed with the turnout for
the Winter Intramurals. The

turnout has been light, and he

attributed the light turnout to the

inclement weather and the fact
that many people work in the
afternoons, (see results of winter
intramurals above.) He is

optomistic about the upcoming
Spring Intramurals (see sign-up
dates below.) He feels there will
be a good turnout this spring; he
hopes that with the coming of
warm weather people will be

ready to get outside and

participate in physical activities.
Dr. Harvill encourages men

and women to come out and

participate in intramurals. “We

like to have separate men’s and
women’s lea.ns, but we’ve been

unable to do that because so few

girls come out. This winter we

had a couple of girls who played
on the men’s basketball teams.”
He expressed some concern about
the fact that very few women

take part in any type of athletic
or fitness programs. He described
the majority of girls at CJC to be

“physically weak”; “we’ve had

some girls who couldn’t properly
control a tennis raquet.” He also

seems to think that both men and

women fail to recognize their

bodily needs with respect to

physical fitness and a good diet.

Dr. Harvill also commented on

future plans for the physical
education department at CJC. He
informed us that plans had been

drawn for a gymnasium and dance

studio; but because of a decision
to build a new library; the plans
for the expansion of physical
education facilities have been

delayed indefinitely. It seems as

though a new library has been

deemed more important than new

physical education facilities. He

also speculated on the prospect of
intercollegiate sports teams at

CJC; saying flatly “we’re not

ready for intercollegiate sports
teams, if we did start an

intercollegiate program, we would

almost have to double the student
activities fee”.

Sign up dates for spring
intramurals;
Softball . . . April 4-7
Badminton Doubles April 25-28
Tennis Singles . .May 24
Golf tournament May 9-12

men - 18 holes
women - 9 holes

Bowling . . May 16-17
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hAovit Review

"Rocky” Offers
Encouragement

l‘m always skeptical when 1 go see a movie that has consistantly,
received fantastic reviews. How coul3^ny movie be so great that everyone
likes it? With “Rocky”, all those fantastic reviews are true.

Sylvester Stallone stars as Rocky Balboa, the unknown fighter who is

given the chance to prove himself. Rocky possesses a “down-home” street

philosophy and he combines “macho” with tenderness. Talia Shire gives a

great and realistic performance as Rocky’s girlfriend who blossoms from

shyness into confidence and beauty.
“Rocky” is a positive movie in an era which is saturated with,

pessimism. It makes the movie goer feel good. It uplifts the spirit and

offers encouragement for tomorrow. Without a doubt, it is one of the best

movies that I’ve seen in a long time.
- K. E. Allen \
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WHAT DO YOU SAY ??—

Do you often say things that do not really reflect your true feelings? It

seems that sometimes people are unable to come right out and say what

they are really thinking. We’ve compiled a few of the most popular things
people say when evading their feelings:

WHAT WE SAY

Hello. It’s been at least two years
since I’ve seen you.

I just came in here to have one

drink.

I really shouldn’t.

I have to work late tonight.

I hope you don’t mind ....

I’ll get back to ya later.

I guess I’ll talk to you later.

Sure, I’ll help you with your

problem.

Let’s get together sometime .soon.

I’ve got to stay home and study.

You can always trust me.

WHAT WE MEAN

I can’t remember your name.

I’m depressed and I plan to get
smashed.

I’m going to anyway.

I’m going out with my secretary.

1 know this really makes you

mad, but that’s tough.
Good-bye forever.

You’re boring me.

Why don’t you go see a

psychologist.

I couldn’t care less if I ever see

you again.
I’ve got other plans.

You’d better not trust me.

Note: USE ONLY NO. 2 PENCIL; DO NOT ERASE

Hi! Are you somewhat confused about what you want to do with your life,

and not really sure what type of occupation you’d like to pursue? This test

may hold the answer. 1 found that I was a natural for a librarian position in

the CJC Library. If you want to find out what you really ought to be

doing, forge ahead.

1. Where would you be most comfortable:
A. Waiting in line to get into a bathroom
B. A nudist colony in Alaska
C. Talking to a person with bad breath

j)'. Sitting in the desks in CJC classrooms (folding top variety)

6. While in class at CJC, do you:
,'AJi Laugh at your instructors corny jokes

Doodle
Collect phone numbers

r\ Tol/-» Mr\_nr\'7

7. Do you feel that:
A. You’re crazy
B. You’re not crazy, but everyone else is

(D. We’re all crazy
D. All of the above

8. Which of the following is most correct:

A. /II of the below
B. Neither A nor C
C. Either A or B

Vp. None of the above

9. Do you someday hope to be:

® Rich and/or famous
B. An instructor at CJC
C. A groundskeeper at CJC
D. Dean of students; CJC

10.Would you rather be:

A. A pet rock
B. A tree

C. An Aardvark
A security policeman at CJC

11.Would you rather be:

A. A tree in a forest fire
B. Smokey The Bear in a forest fire

Boxing Muhammed Ali
D. Taking the Regents’ Test

12. Would you rather smoke:
A. A cigarette
B. A pipe
C. A cigar

Get smoked on a standardized test

12.Would you rather be:
A. A worker in the cafeteria

^ A steak sandwich in the cafeteria
A person trying to chew a steak sandwich in the cafeteria

2. What would you most like to do:

Go to a Lyceum presentation
B. Attend a piano recital

C. Attend an English 111 or 112 class

D. Attend a funeral

3. Would you rather be ripped of by:
A. Your best friend

CEP Someone you didn’t know
C. A door to door salesman
D. The CJC bookstore

Determination of your occupation: Simply take the number of D answers

and multiply it by the number of classes you have missed. Multiply this by
the number of times you have experienced ecstacy at CJC. Find your

occupation below:
If your Number was
O - You are in the right field. Student at CJC
Infinity - you ought to apply at the nearest mental institution

A negative number - Smokey the Aardvark
Infinity + 1 - Visit the Marine Corp. Recruiting Station nearest you.

******* Bonus Questions:

4. Would you rather:
A. Go five minutes extra in class

ê Give up spring break

Bribe your professor, and forget the whole thing
D. Just call off winter quarter and receive a free meal in the CJC

cafeteria as a refund for your tuition fee.

5. Would you rather read:
A. The Wall Street Journal

(g? The Atlanta Journal
C. The Bent Tree
D. Writing on bathroom walls (try D-lOO)

Clayton Offers
Aviation

Degree
Unlike many junior colleges in

Georgia, Clayton Junior offers an

Associate of Science Degree in
Aviation Administration. In

cooperation with Georgia State

University, CJC offers this career

program designed to provide
college-level training in general
educati on and professional
aviation management.

Aviation employment is
available not only in the airline

industry, but also in the areas of
business and corporate flying,
personal flying, flight instruction,
and numerous military and

government positions. Having
experienced training in

professional courses, graduates of
the CJC program may work in
various capacities for commercial

airlines, aircraft manufacturers,
private corporations, fixed base

operations, government agencies.

and research and development
firms.

Present aviation employees
and students wishing to transfer

into the program are encouraged
to consult the registrar’s office on

credit transferability of any prior
college work. A person wishing to

work toward the degree must

meet the criteria established by
CJC and Georgia State University.

The major field professional
courses are offered only through
Georgia State; however, one nice

feature of the program is that

many of these courses are offered
on site at CJC.

G.S. Kordecki is the faculty
advisor for the program and has

descriptive literature available for

interested students. For details

call 363-7763 or stop by the
Divison of Business at Cl IN.

14.Would you rather listen to:

A. Your parents nagging
B. The sound of fingernails scratching a blackboard
C. The bookstore lady yelling and screaming
D. Water dripping from the ceilings at CJC

15. Jimmy Carter:
A. Is an ex-peanut farmer
B. is part owner of a toothpaste factory
C. Has his teeth cleaned at CJC Dental Lab
D. Wears false teeth

dupel Editorial

Take Time

To Care

Recently, I saw singer Lyn
Kellog perform. In her

performance she sang a song
about a girl who was looking for a

“superman” that would take care

of her. The song was not as

interesting as Kellog’s
introduction of the song. It was

an extremely negative
introduction; she put down the
character in the song and also
herself when she acted like the
character in the song.

This says something important
about the society in which we

live. In so many of today’s songs,
books, and movies, negative
emphasis is placed on people’s
dependence on each other. If we

depend on someone, we are

automatically labeled as “weak”;
if we are female, we are labeled as

“unliberated” as well. In today’s
world we must be “strong”,
“self-reliant”, and “independent”.

How far we’ve come since
Barbra Streisand sang that

“people who need people are the
luckiest people in the world”! I’m
not sure that the distance has
been progress, either. Don’t get
me wrong. I’m not knocking
“strong”, “self-reliant”, or

“independent”; I’m knocking the

way we define those words.

Today “strong” has become not

crying when you’re overwhelmed
by the beauty of a sunset or not

saying “I love you”. “Self-reliant”
now means doing it all on your
own. An “independent” attitude
not only means that you’re not

dominated but that you don’t’
care what anybody else thinks or

does.
It seems that we’ve created a

society in which we don’t have/
time for other people. I’m guilty
of it, too. If I had a dollar for'
every time I’ve told a member of

my family or a friend to go away
because I’m busy. I’d be a rich

lady. Not only do we not have
time for others, but we don’t have
time for ourselves, either. We’re
so wrapped up in maintaining a

facade of “strength” and

“independence” that we aren’t
able to say “I need you”. We’ve
become so involved in an

impersonal age that we forget that
we’re all people; we all have

feelings and needs; we all have

hopes and dreams.
I’d like to propose some new

definitions for those three words.

Perhaps “strong” should mean

being brave enough to care and

making yourself vulnerable.
Perhaps “self-reliant” should
include relying on your own

initiative in seeking aid when you

really need it. As for

“independence”, how about being
yourself, not a carbon copy of

everyone else? Like the song says,

“people who need people are the

luckiest people in the world”;
why? Because they’re alive

enough to care and to reach out

and be vulnerable. If we’re

“strong” enough to face the

world without our masks,
“self-reliant” enough to seek out

other people, and “independent”
■■ enough to be “real”, then maybe
we’ll be among those lucky
people who need people.

- K. E. Allen
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Clayton Junior College
recently named 219 students to

its Fall Quarter 1976 Dean’s List,
according to Dr. Billy Nail,
Academic Dean.

To be eligible for the Dean’s

List, a student must maintain at

least a 3.6 grade point average out

of a possible 4.0 for the quarter.

Clayton Junior College
Dean's List, Fall Quarter, 1976:

Paul C. Aaron, Morrow; Roy
W. Adams, Jr., East Point; Susan
A. Allen, Riverdale; Larry B.

Anderson, Morrow; Vernon E.

Avant, East Point; Dennis A.

Baer, Conley; Francine O. Baer,
Conley; John B. Barabas,
Riverdale; Harvey L. Beasley,
Forest Park; Debra R. Bolton,
Atlanta; Peggy D. Booth,
Morrow; Trena E. Boswell,
Forest Park: Judith B. Bowling,
College Park; Judith K.

Bramlett, Fayetteville;
Stephanie D. Bray, Fayetteville;
Patricia A. Breed,

Stockbridge; Terry A. Brinkley,
Riverdale; Anita E. Brumlow,
Morrow; Bradley D. Bryant,
Forest Park; Billy T. Burke,
College Park; Peny G. Caldwell,
East Point; Deborah C. Canada,
Turin; Patricia A, Cann,
Morrow; Melanie L. Carithers,
Morrow; Sandra L. Carlson,
Jonesboro; Donald E.

Cartwright, Jonesboro; Linda C.

Champaign, Jonesboro; Jane E,

Clark. Peachtree City; Elizabeth
A. Cole, Hampton; Rosalyn M.

Cole, Hampton;
Virginia G. Combs,

Jonesboro; Sandralyn Cordell,
Riverdale; Keith A. Cornell,
Riverdale; John L. Cowherd,
Morrow; Catherine M, Dailey,
Riverdale; Barbara S, Daniel

College Park; Jane Y. Daniel,
Morrow; Joseph A. Daniel, Jr.,
Fayetteville; Denise J.

Daugherty, Forest Park; Sandra
W. Davis, Forest Park; Michael
A. Dawson, Fayetteville; Judith
L. Denney, Lake City; Charles
G. Denton HI, College Park;
Teresa L. Dickens, East Point;
Timothy B. Dickerson, Morrow;
Patricia S. Dobbs,

Ellenwood; Walter E. Doll, Jr.,
Riverdale; Harriet E. Downs,
Morrow; Theresa C. Dozier,
Smyrna; Sharon A. Durbin,
Stockbridge; Rene E.

Dziejowski, College Park;
Catherine P. Eaton, Morrow;
Nancy B. Eaton, I'orest Park;

Fall Dean’s List

Victoria B. Edes, East Point;
Connie D. Edmondson, College
Park; Margaret D. Egger, East
Point; Susan M. Eller, Morrow;
Janet C. Exum, Hampton;
Robert K. Exum, Hampton;
Evelyn B. Farr, Fayetteville;

Lisa L. Floyd, Gainesville;
Louise J. Ford, College Park;
Dottie G. Forehand, Mableton;
Suzanne B. Forsyth, Conley;
Martha J. Fowler, Morrow;
Eileen M. French, College Park;
Tina B. Futral, Jonesboro; Terri
L. Gay, College Park; Cheryl E.
Germany, Forest Park; Belinda
J. Gibson, Stockbridge; Ellen E.

Gilbert, Morrow; Vickie R.

Graham, Fayetteville; Ann V.

Grantham, Morrow; Kenneth H.

Green, College Park;
Eleanor R. Griffin, Morrow;

Terry B. Griggs, Morrow;
Virginia L. Guild, Atlanta; Betty
A. Halm, East Point; James P.

Hardie, College Park; Pamela C.

Harmon, College Park; Vickie L.

Hartzog, Forest Park; Dorothy
L. Helms, Fayetteville; Deborah
G. Helton, College Park; Donald
M. Hickman, Riverdale; Sandra
S. Holland, East Point; Donna S.

Holley, Morrow; Lenora J.

Holloway, Decatur; Stephen A.

Holt, College Park; Sandra K.

Howard, Hampton;
Tina T. Hughes, Morrow;

Lucia S. Huie, Atlanta; Laurel
B. Humber, Atlanta; Marquita
M. Israel, Jonesboro; Barbara R.

Jackson, Peachtree City;
Kathryn L. Jensen, Forest Park;
N. Filien Johnson, Morrow;
Robert R, Johnson, Jonesboro;
Ashley M. Jones, College Park;
Kaye G. Jones, College Park;
Richard L, Jones, Forest Park;
Lois A. Josey, Fayetteville;
Robert W. Kelley, Jr,, Riverdale;
Stephen B, Kujawa, Riverdale;
Richard T, Lallier, College Park;

Anita L. Lawrence, Lake

City; Eugenia R. Leader,
Riverdale; Barbara F, Lee,
College Park; Cyndi W, Lee,

Hapevillc; Emmie M. Lee,
Forest Park; Phyllis A, Lee,
Fayetteville; William A. Lee,

Riverdale; Curtis A, Lewis,
College Park; JoAnn Livingston,
Hampton; Lillie E, Long,
Hapeville, William E, Lyerly,
Forest Park; Patsy G. Mabry,
Riverdale; Ruth B, Mallehan,
East Point; Paul L, Marchbanks,
College Park; Cindy L, Martin,
Forest Park;

Joyce A, Martin, Riverdale;
Andrew W, Mask, F'ayetteville;
Gary S, Mask, Fayetteville;
Donald L, Mason, McDonough;
Barbara D, Masters, Fayetteville;
Susan J, Matthews, Morrow;
Judy V, Maurer, Riverdale;
Vickie E, McAfee, Jonesboro;
Pamela A, McBerry, Forest

Park; Thomas R, McBerry,
McDonough; Gary M,

McBroom, College Park; Maria
F. McCann, Jonesboro; Jean B,

McClure, Morrow; William D,

McLarty, East Point; Billy J,

McLeod, Jr., Lake City;
Trapie E. Miller, Forest Park;

Melanie A, Mitchell,
Fayetteville; David B. Moats,
Morrow; Joy A. Moore, East

Point; Joy M. Morris, Morrow;
Joyce A, Morris, Forest Park;
William S, Morris, Forest Park;
Rita J. Munoz, College Park;
Linda C. Nasworthy, Locust

Grove; Marilyn R, Newby,
.Morrow; Greta N. Newton,
Morrow; Lisa D. Nicholas,
Atlanta; Judith M. Noies,
College Park; Nora J. Norman,
Forest Park; Timothy G.

Parrott, Jonesboro;
John P. Parsons III, Morrow;

Janet M. Pass, Fayetteville;
Daniel S. Patton, Williamson;
Silvia T. Peterson, College Park;
Brenda Y. Phillips, Morrow;
Norma D. Pierce, Forest Park;
Rebecca E. Pilotte, Jonesboro;
Terri D. Pitts, Jonesboro; David
W. Plunkett, Riverdale; Dorothy
M. Pollard, Fairburn; Nathan 11.

Pridemore, Riverdale; Paul B.

Priest, Morrow; Jeania R,

Purcell, Alpharetta; Wanda T,

Purinton, Forest Park; Maryjean
H. Quinn, Decatur;

Leah FI. Ratzel, Hapeville;
Katherine S . R a y b o r n.
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Riverdale; Ginger M. Reece,
Hapeville; Carol A. Reeves,
Inman; Mary D. Rice, Riverdale;
Shirley C. Richardson,
Jonesboro; Terri L. Rush, East

Point; Rita D. Salueci,
Riverdale; Blanche T. Sellers,
East Point; Jill C. Sewell,
College Park; David M. Sexton,
Griffin; James G. Shaiebly,
Jonesboro; Deborah L. Shields,
Morrow; Stephen E. Shivers,
Snellville; Martha S. Simmons,
Riverdale;

Terry Sinquefield, East

Point; Joseph M. Slife,
Jonesboro; Linda C. Smith,
Hampton; Lucinda M. Smith,
Fairburn; Betty W. Soublis,
Forest Park; Darrell B. Sowell,
Jonesboro; Lydia C. Starke,
Forest Park; Kenneth T. Steele,
Morrow; Michael E. Steele,
Conyers; Ronald H. Stewart,
College Park; Carole G. Stupar,
Union City; Robert K. Sudduth,
Rex; Connie A. Tatum, East
Point; Nancy E. Taylor,
Fayetteville;Winnie M, Thacker,
Conley;

Crawford L, Thomas, East
Point; Elizabeth V, Thomas,
Jonesboro; Linda Thomas,
College Park; Elyene S,

Thompson, Jonesboro; Judith
T. Thompson, Fayetteville;
Carmen R. Thorpe, College
Park; Earl G, Turner, Jonesboro;
William H, Valliant IV,
Fayetteville; Tu Anh Vu,
Jonesboro; Mary R, Wagner, j.
Union City; Carolyn V, Wall, > •

Union City; Sandra L, Watson, > ■

Griffin; Judith P, Wayda, J’
Riverdale; J’

Andrew T, Wear, East Point; j,
Jeanette C, Wear, East Point; |,
Donna J. Weaver, Fairburn; I-
Perry M, Westberry, Forest
Park; Linda L, Wheeler, College
Park; Anita M, Whitaker, Lithia j.
Springs; Joyce H, Whittelsey, j.
College Park; Norma D, Wildes, j-
Atlanta; Debbie A, Wiley,1-
Forest Park; Keith A. Wilkerson, *

‘

Jonesboro; Donald ■

j .

Wilkinson, Jonesboro; Mary E, j ,

Wright, East Point. j.
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RegentsAct On GIs,Old
ATLANTA - The University System of Georgia Board of

Regents has acted to exempt military personnel and

dependents from non-resident tuition and to allow residents

62 and over to attend credit courses free if space is available.

Acting at their January meeting, the Regents made the

military non-resident tuition exemption effective Summer

Quarter. Currently, the military must pay the higher non-

resident tuition if they are not residents.
The Board voted to ask the Southern Association of

Colleges and Schools to discuss accredition of courses at the

point they are given, rather than at the location of the college
itself. The Regents said they were concerned about the

quality of some courses given atmilitary bases in Georgia by
colleges from as far away as California, Utah and Colorado.

The Regents made the rules effective for Fall Quarter 1977

for residents 62 and over to attend credit courses free if space
is available. Georgia voters approved in November a con-

stitutional amendment giving the elderly this privilege.
The Board adopted a policy forbidding employes from

holding political office at the state or federal level an’d for-

bidding political activity during working hours.

The Regents voted to make no changes at this time in a

requirement that all seniors, before graduating, must take
an examination in the field in which they majored. They do

not have to pay for or pass the examination and the score is

not recorded on their transcripts.

Approved was an administrative reorganization plan for
the University of Georgia which combines the office of

provost into the office of Vice President for Academic Af-
fairs, as recommended by President Fred Davison.

Regent Charles Oxford of Albany, Board vice chairman,
was elected chairman to replace Dr. John Bell of Dublin
whose term as Regent expired Jan. l. Regent Milton Jones of
Columbus was elected vice chairman.
Dr. Neila A. Poshek, Dean of the College of Nursing at

Tulsa University, was appointed Dean of the School of

Nursing at the Medical College of Georgia. Dr. John David
Burke was appointed assistant vice president for services at
the University c£ Georgia, Dr. Leo Parrish Jr. as head of the

department of management at Georgia Southern, Dr. Terry
Kammash as Fuller E. Callaway Professor of Nuclear

Engineering at Georgia Tech, and Dr. Irwin Perlin as

professor emeritus at Georgia Tech.
The Board voted to purchase a private dormitory complex

and 27 acres from Holiday Inn, Inc. for $350,000 and to spend
another $280,000 in renovating and equipping it for Georgia
Southern College, which is adjacent to the property.
The Regents voted to hold a retreat-type meeting at the

System facilities on Skidaway Island near Savannah May 27-
29. In-depth discussions, not possible at regular meetings
because of time limitations, will be held at the retreat.

All Ages Can Do It
Although breast cancer is usu-

ally found in women of middle

age and over, the American
Cancer Society urges all worn-
en from high school age on to

practice breast self-examina-
tion.
The breast cancer death toll

is high—an estimated 33,000
annually says the American
Cancer Society. But it could

change for the better if more

women regularly practiced
breast self-examination and
consulted their doctors if they
noticed any change.

Monthly
Date

Mark it on your calendar.Once
a month — every month. BSE.
Breast self-examination.
Life-saving protection

against one of woman’s deadli-
est enemies—breast cancer.
95% of breast cancers are

discovered by women them-
selves. And the earlier the
detection and treatment, the
greater the chances of cure.

Ask your local Unit for our
leaflet on breast self-exami-
nation.Then mark your cal-
endar—BSE. Every month.

American
Cancer Society
New Techniques

Besides breast self-examina-
tion, several new methods such
as mammography (x-rays) and
thermography (heat patterns)
help detect breast cancer. Eai ly
detection means, a greater
chance for life says the Amer-
ican Cancer Society. Ask your
doctor or local hospital clinic
about these tests.

OXFORD
Chairman

JONES
V. Chairman


