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FACULTY TO PRESENT MIKADO -GE

“THE MIKADO” - Dr. Elina Zimmerman, “Katisha,” and Mr. Charles Stone,
Emperor of Japan,” rehearse a scene from “The .Mikado.”
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Miy Becomes New Food Service Director

will serve the student in a

pleasant manner with high
quality food and an extra
touch of care and concern.”

She continued by
informing the Bent Tree that
the cafeteria is open to the
public as well as the campus
family from 8:00 a.m. to
8:30 p.m., Monday through
Thursday and from 8:00 a.m.

to 2:00 p.m. Friday. There is
a daily menu which includes a

daily special, sandwiches
from the short order line, and
a daily entree with hot-line
vegetables.

Some of the experience
which qualifies Mrs. May for

by Julia Youngblood

With the advent of the
Fall Semester, Maureen May
tookover as Manager of Food
Services in the Clayton Junior
College Cafeteria.

Her duties include being
responsible for the
employees, ordering food,
planning the menus, as well as
working with other
departments on campus in
arranging functions from
punch and cookie affairs to
special banquets. Regarding
her work in the cafeteria,
Mrs. May stated, “The
atmosphere is one we hope

Maureo;! May, New Food Service Directc)r

this position includes a year
teaching a Career Education
Home Economics Course in
Denver, Colorado. Prior to
that she worked at the well
known Brown Palace Hotel in
Denver as an Assistant
Executive Steward. She has
also filled two supervisory
capacities with the Purdue
/University Residence Hall
Food Service which served
thirteen halls.

Mrs. May came to Atlanta
about four months ago with
her husband, Larry who
works for Merrill Lynch,
Pierce, and Fenner and
Smith. Her special interests
include bird watching, skiing,
motorcycling, and hiking.

Encouraging comments

and questions from those
who utilize the cafeteria
facilities Mrs. May states, “I
do want to know what their
wants and needs are. I will be

happy to talk to anyone and
am looking forward to

meeting them.” Please make
your wants and needs known

concerning desires for special
food items, matters regarding
policy, or special function
facilities available by
contacting her at the cafeteria
or by telephoning 363-7733.

This desire to establish her
new position as a challenge to
be met as efficiently as

po.ssible, yet with the welfare
of those she serves in mind,
indicates the warm and
gracious addition she is to our

Ulayton Junior College
campus.

by Lynne Duren

On October 21 and 22,
students, as well as the
public, will be able to make a

visit to Japan free of charge.
How? It will be the second
annual “Faculty Frolics” and
this year’s presentation will
be The Mikado.

The Mikado, written by W.
S. Gilbert and orchestrated
by Arthur Sullivan, is a most
humorous opera that can also
be described as a “Japanese
remake of Peyton Place.”

The story, which takes
place in the town of Titipu,
opens just as Nanki-Poo has
escaped from his father, the
Mikado of Japan, to escape
marriage to the elderly
Katisha. However, as most
stories based on romance go,
our hero (Nanki-Poo) has a

love of his own - the fair
Maiden Yum-Yum. At this
point though, we find all is
not “hearts and cupids.”
Yum-Yum’s guardian Ko-Ko
(who in the story can be most

accurately compared with a

secret service agent in a

Kamona) has plans of his own
to marry the beautiful
Yum-Yum.

Ko-Ko, who has been
sentenced to death for
flirting, later becomes Lord
High Executioner which
would make the carrying out
of his sentence more than
tricky!

Throughout the opera we

find the usual love triange -

the lovesick hero in love with
the fair maiden and the
part-time bodyguard
part-time executioner in love
with her also.

The story has a very
surprising ending as well as a

most humorous one.

The cast, made up of very
serious and dedicated
members of the CJC faculty,
is as follows:

Nanki-Poo - Larry Corse

(son of the Mikado)
Ko-Ko - Don Crapps (Lord

High Executioner)
Pooh-Bah - Bill Pasch

(Lord High Anything
Else)

Pish-Tish - Bill Gore (A
Noble Lord)

Yum-Yum - Peggy Grooms
Pitti-Sing - Doris Holloway

Peep-Bo - Jeannine
Morrison

Katisha - Elena
Zimmerman (An
Elderly lady in love
with Nanki-Poo)

The Mikado - Charles
Stone

The Mikado is one of
many enjoyable as well as

educational concerts to be
presented by Lyceum this
quaiter. Others on the agenda
include:

CJC Student Recital -

October 26, 12 noon; George
Petsch, Guitar Recital - Nov.
2, 12 noon; CJC Choir
Concert - Nov. 9, 12 noon;

Eugene Martin, Piano Recital
- Nov. 15, 8:30 p.m.; CJC
Band Concert - Nov. 16, 12
noon; CJC Ensembles - Nov.
23. 12 noon; CJC Student
Recital - Nov. 29, 8:30 p.m.;
CJC Student Recital - Nov.
30, 12 noon; Christmas
Dinner/Musical - “Herod” -

Dec. 9-10, 7:00 p.m.
All concerts take place in

room G-132. All students are

urged to attend, and don't
forget - The Mikado, October
21-22, 8:00 p.m. G-132.

SGA Discusses

Faculty Evaluation
by Cheryl Carter and Kathy Kaurin

The Student Government
Association (SGA) met on

Monday, October 3, with

Vice-President, James
Jernigan, presiding.

The first issue on the
agenda concerned the
possibility of publishing the
Faculty Evaluation Reports.
Opposition was voiced about
disclosing this information to
the student body.

Elections will be held this
quarter for a possible 6
undeclared seats in the SGA
Senate.

Plans have been made for
distribution of suggestion
boxes throughout the CJ('
campus in order to get
maximum input from the

student body.
At present, the SGA

meets on afternoons twice
each month. This is not
convenient for those night
students who would like to

participate. Therefore a

suggestion was made to hold
one meeting at night to
increase the representation of
night students.

All students are invited
and urged to attend SGA
meetings. Officers of the
Student Govern m e n1

Association include:
President, Jenny O’Leary;
Vice-President, James
Jernigan; Treasurer, Sharon
Wilkerson; and Secretary.
Jennifer Morgan.
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FACULTY

SPOTLIGHT

by Stewart Lipham

Dr. O. C. Lam III,
Chairman of the Division of
Natural Sciences and
Mathematics and Associate
Professor of Biology begins
his ninth year at CJC this fall.
Dr. Lam has been at the

college since its opening in
196h.

As chairman of Math and

Science, Dr. Lam is

constantly looking at changes
or additions to career

programs, curriculum, and
course content. As many as

three or four options may be
under consideration at one

time.
Dr. Lam was born and

raised in Rome, Ga. He first
became interested in Biology
in high school. His interest in

teaching began in leadership
positions within the Boy
Scouts, and was further
aroused as a lab assistant in

college. He attended Shorter

College, where he received his
A.B. in 1966. He received his
Ph.D. in 1972 from the

University of Georgia.
Dr. Lam is married (sorry

girls!) and his wife is a high
school Enghsh teacher. His

many hobbies include:

antiques, camping, hiking,
and cooking. He is also a

District Vice-Chairman with

the Boy Scouts, and has two
(yes count them two!) games
of chess going with Dean [
Bolander at all times.

Dr. Lam is very concerned I
about wildlife preservation.
He is Chairman of the Board
of the W. H. Reynolds
Memorial Preserve, which is a |
wildlife area here in Clayton
County. He is also on the
board of the Marshall Forest,
a wildlife area in Rome.

Dr. Cicero Ends Term

as Head of AMATYC

By T. Barry

The American
Mathematical Association of
Two Year Colleges,
AMATYC, held its annual

meeting at the Peachtree
Plaza last week.

Dr. Joseph E. Cicero, a

professor of mathematics at

CJC, ended his term as

president of the AMATYC

during this five day meeting,
but will still have duties to

perform as past president. He
stated in a message to the
members of the AMATYC',
“

. . . that AMATYC exists to

fill a void. Specifically, for

two year college teachers,
there was lack of involvement
in peer review of educational

programs designed to meet

their needs. There was lack of
communication between two

year college teachers and high
level policy makers

(Congress). There was no

national professional identity
for two year college teachers.
There was no involvement in
the training and preparation
of future two year college
teachers, and the list goes
on.”

Concerning the annual

meeting. Dr. Cicero went on

to state, “We have

representatives from senior

institutions, industry and
related disciplines to

complement our ourstanding
corps of two year college
speakers.

Dr. Cicero has testified
before a committee of the
House of Representatives
concerning the funding of

higher education by the
National Science Foundation.

The AMATYC was

established in 197.5 and most

of the mathematics
instructors here are members.

Student Affuits Committee
A

Inventifates Needs

by Art Rogers

In the regularly scheduled
meeting of the Student
Affairs Committee, it was

moved and seconded to

establish a sub-committee
composed of Dean Bolander,
Dr. Fisher, and James

Jernigan to present a

preliminary report at the next

meeting on the needs

concerning the student

lounging areas.

SGA Vice President James

Jernigan suggested that the
stereo system in the student

lounge be connected in such a

way as to concentrate on a

specific area of the cafeteria.
“This would form a listening
area for the students who
want music with their meal.’’
he stated.

The committee went on

to discuss ways in which they
could improve the student
lounging areas. This includes

the cafeteria, C-building
lobby, the television room,
and the student lounge. After
further discussion, the vote

was taken and passed
unanimously.

In other action, the
committee also established a

sub-committee to present a

preliminary report concerning
the participation and
effectiveness of the

Wednesday Activity Hour.
The s u b-c o m m i 11 e e

,

composed of Rob Taylor,
Dennie Kelley, and Sharon
Wilkerson is to investigate
circumstances involved in

why the Activity Hour has
such a low student
involvement count.

Other actions taken by
the committee include
establishing a sub-committee
to present a report on the
potential needs of night
students and establishing a

sub-committee to present a

report regarding publicity
efforts in the area of student
activities.

Georgia
searcL

The search is on to find
Miss Georgia-USA 1978, the

young woman who will

represent Georgia in the MISS
USA Beauty Pageant next

May, which will be telecast
nationally by CBS-TV.

In addition to more than
$75,000 in prizes and awards
on the national level as well
as an opportunity to

represent this country in the
Miss Universe Pageant next

summer in Mexico, the new

Miss Georgia will receive
other valuable awards as the
state winner.

To qualify, applicants
must be single and never

married between the ages of

18and 26 as of July 15, 1978
and must live, work or attend
school anywhere in Georgia.
They also must be U.S.
citizens and can not have
been a parent.

Judging will be based on

beauty of face and figure,
poise, personality, grooming,
intelligence, speaking ability
and commercial appeal.
THERE IS NO TALENT
COMPETITION.

All contestants will be
selected on an open, At-Large
basis by the pageant Selection
Committee. Those chosen
will advance to the state

finals to be held a weekend in
March 1978. The pageant will
be telecast for the first lime
since 1971.
The reigning Miss

Georgia USA, L.inda Kerr of

Alpharetta, was one of I he

top finalists in the 1977 Miss
USA Pageant as was Liz

Wickersham, Miss Georgia
1976.

Free entry information is
available by writing to: Miss
Ga.-USA Pageant, P. O. Box
67 6, Silver Spring, Md.
20906.

Applicants should send
their name, address, age, and
telephone number. Deadline
for all applications is
December 15, 1977.

Error

Reported
Last issue, the Bent Tree

misspelled James Braun’s
name. We apologize for this
error and hereby stand
corrected.

James Braun

photo by Stewart Lipham

Dr. I—I orveq sJackîon

Dr. J.

Scores
By T. Barry

Dr. Harvey H. Jackson,
Associate Professor of
History at Clayton Junior will
have his first book, “In the

Eye of the Storm: Georgia’s
General Lachlan McIntosh
and the Forces of
Revolutionary Factionalism,”
published next year by the
University of Georgia Press.

In a recent Bent Tree

Interview, Dr. Jackson
said,“ . . . they (the
University of Georgia Press)
will probably try to have it
(the book) out sometime
toward the end of next
summer ... It will be
distributed mainly in Georgia
and the southeast.”

General McIntosh served
in the American Revolution
and was Georgia’s first
general. He commanded the

Georgia forces until 1777,
when he was pressured to
leave the state after killing
Button Gwinnett (famed
signer of the Declaration of

Independence) in a dual.
McIntosh later joined George
Washington’s army. Dr.
Jackson’s book emerged from
his disertation paper on

McIntosh and has taken six

years, off and on, to

complete. He has
concentrated work on the
book for the past eight
months. Dr, Jackson used
sources from the Archives
and Savannah among other

places, mainly in Georgia.
Dr, Jackson already has an

idea in mind for another
book. “I’ve gotten about six
articles published, mostly on

the American Revolution,”
he said. He also commented

that, “the nice thing about
here (CJC) is that you can

work at pretty much your
own pace.”

Dr. Jackson received his
Ph.D. in History from the

University of Georgia anil
ininored in English. Best of
luck to him on his further
writings.
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Nursing Receives Grant
A $2 6,5 39 grant to

support the nursing education
program at Clayton Junior
College has been awarded by
the Department of Health,
Education and Welfare.

Dr. O. C. Lam HI,
Chairman of the Division of
Natural Sciences and
Mathematics at the Morrow

institution, received
notification of the grant from
Jessie M. Scott, Assistant
Surgeon General and Director
of the Division of Nursing for
HEW. CJC’s Department of
Nursing operates within the
Division of Natural Sciences
and Mathematics.

Issued under the “Nursing
Capitation Grant Program,”
funds may be used for any
purpose the college judges
will most effectively advance
its nursing program. The
intention of the Capitation
Grant is to provide a support
base for an educational
program, including general
operating expenses.

The amount of the grant
was based on enrollment data
presented by the college.

Various factors, including
full-time classroom
enrollment and the number
of graduates in the nursing
program during the year in
which a grant is made, are
used as guidelines for HEW’s
funding formula.

Funds awarded in 1977
are for the grant period of
July 1, 1977 through June
30, 1978, but the college may
obligate left-over funds for
the following year.

One of 13 “career
programs” offered at Clayton
Junior College, the Nursing
Program is tailored to
specifically meet the need for
nurses in the south
metropolitan Atlanta area.
Career programs at CJC
combine general education
courses with specialized
professional or paraprofes-
sional training to prepare
graduates with immediate
employment after two years
of study.

Ms. Mary deChesnay is
Head of CJC’s Department of
Nursing, which includes a

faculty of seven. As a part of

the educational program,
faculty and students
participate in community
service activities, both on and
off campus.
Through this clinical

agreement between the
college and a number of
community hospitals and
health agencies, students are

introduced to actual
laboratory experiences. The
nursing profession has always
placed an emphasis on

community involvement.
Accredited by the

National League for Nursing,
Clayton Junior College has
offered the two-year nursing
program since it opened in
September 1969. Also
accredited by the Georgia
Board of Nursing, the college
holds membership in the
Council of Associate Degree
Programs of the National
League for Nursing.

A unit of the University
System of Georgia, Clayton
Junior College is currently in
its ninth year of operation.

CJC Men In Blue
Beth Gray and Denise Simmons

Lecture on Crimes
AnnouncedA A AA AAAAAAA4rAA AAt

Children
Needed

A small group of
youngsters are needed to
assist members of the Clayton
Junior College Choir in a

Christmas dinner/theatre
production of “Herod,”
according to Dr. Larry B.
Corse, Director of the Choir.

“We need girls and boys
between the ages of 7 and 13,
whose voices are unchanged,
to sing and act in the play,”
Dr. Corse pointed out. “We
would like to have between
10 and 15 youngsters to work
with our choir.”

■Area girls and boys who
would like to participate
must call the' college to make
an appointment for a

10-minute audition before
Dr. Corse. “We will hold
auditions between 4 and 8
p.m. on Monday, October 24,
but parlicipants must call for
an assigned time,” Dr. Corse
said.
Auditions may be

scheduled with the secretary
in the college’s Division of
Humanities (phone
363-7"43). the choir director
pointed out. Anyone
auditioning should come

prepared to sing a Christmas
carol of their selection.

Participants accepted will
be re(|uired to attend
approximately two rehearsals
during November, and two or

three more during the week
of the production.

"Herod" will be featured
during 7 p.m. performances
in the college cafeteria on

Iriday, December 9, and
again on Saturday, December
10.

A former Special Agent in
Charge and Police Training
Coordinator for the FBI will
give two lectures on “Sex
Crimes” Wednesday, October
19, at Clayton Junior College.
Walter V. McLaughlin,

who retired after 36 years of
service with the FBI, will
speak in Room B-14 at 12
noon, and in Room G-132 at
8:30 p.m. Presently a Police
Consultant with the
University of Deleware and
the Pennsylvania Chiefs of
Police Association, he will be
the first speaker in a .series of
lectures on “Law and
Society,” sponsored by the
college’s Lyceum Committee.

During his time with the
Bureau, Mr. McLaughlin
achieved national recognition
for his specialization in the

Beaier to
\

Speak
Mr. Alex Beaier will be

speaking on Advertising and
Free Imterprise at Clayton
J unior College.
Mr. Beaier is very

knowledgeable about the free
enterprise system. He owns

his own advertising agency
and is an author. Among the
books that he has written is
The Art of Blacksniithini;.
which is an excellent book
about the trade.

Mr. Beaier was in the
Uiiilcd States Marine Corps,
and has served in many civil
and polillcal affairs.

Mr. Beaier will be speaking
on October 25, at 7:00 p.m.,
in Room G-132. The program
will be opened to the public
al no cost.

field of “Police Investigation
of the Abnormal Sex
Offender and his Offenses.”
Because of his work
experience, he is considered
an authority in this area.

Mr. McLaughlin prepared
and presented “The Morals
Squad Course.” a forty-hour
series of lectures which has
been adopted by the FBI
which is currently being
taught in schools throughout
the country. For ten years, he
was a guest lecturer at the
FBI National Academy in
Washington. D.C., and in
1963, he was assigned by
Director J. Edgar Hoover to

train the “Boston Strangler
Squad.”

Both lectures will be open
to the public and there will
be no admission charge.

Members of the Georgia
House of Representatives will
meet on the CJC campus
today (Wednesday, October
19) to receive an update on

development of the college,
the college’s financial needs,
accomplishments and other
areas of concern.

In addition to meeting
with representatives of the
college administration and
faculty, the visiting legislators
also will meet with a number
of students.

Members of the Hou.se
Committee on the University
System of Georgia who plan
to attend the afternoon
meeting include: the
Honorable Arthur (iignilliat
of Savannah who is chairman;
Hon. E. B. Toles of Rome,
Vice Chairman; and Hon.

Clayton Junior College is
just like a small city; we are
the ci t izens and the'
administration is the
government and this includes
police officers, too.

The campus police have
all the rights that the city
police have. They have the
responsibility of the security
and safety of our cars,
persons, and everything on

Liimpus.
The problems they have

had to handle range from a

rare fight to theft from cars.

Parking violations have been
the biggest problem so far.
The curb parking next to the
building ended October 5th
so anyone still parking there
can expect a little pink ticket
to appear. Penality for the
first ticket is a run down of
the parking rules. When the
second ticket appears the
dean sets the penality from
anything he feels necessary to
suspension.

Things being stolen out of
cars has not reached an

Hugh Logan of Athens,
Secretary.
Two subcommittees

within the House Committee
will be represented at the
meeting, one on Junior
Colleges-Vocational-Technical
Schools, and another on

Non-Resident Junior
Colleges.
Members of the

Non-Resident subcommittee
include: Hon. James M. Beck
of Valdosta who is chairman,
Hon. Marvin Adams of
Thomaston, Hon. Joseph A.
Battle of Savannah, Hon. Paul
Bolster of Atlanta, Hon. Joe
Burton of Atlanta, Hon. E.
M. (Buddy) (’hilders of
Rome, Hon. Johnny Isakson,
of Marietta, Hon. Rudolph
Johnson of Morrow, Hon.
Randolph C. Karrh of

epidemic, yet, but the police
suggest locking your cars and
taking the keys to help them
out.

The police have also spent
quite a bit of time rescuing
helpless keys and stranded
owners with their trusty
coathangers which they carry
around in their van. Another
problem encountered last
year was speeding but this
year the speed limit seems to
be working.

The authority to give
parking tickets comes from
Dr. Downs. The State has
certified the rest of the
official actions taken by the
CJC police. Our police
departments staff consists of
seven people: Director of
Public Safety, Bill Hart;
Sargent, Ted Ray; and

officers: Maggie Robbins,
David Peak, Marty Castillo,
Greg Thorton, and James
Braswell.

The officers are helping us

so let’s try helping ourselves by
helping them.

Swainsboro, Hon. Ken Nix of
Smyrna. Hon. Tom Ramsey
of Chatsworth, and Hon.
Robert A. (Bob) Irvin of
Roswell.

Members of the Junior
Colleges-Vocational-Technical
Schools s u b c o 111 111 i 11 e e

include: Hon. Li. M. Childers
of Rome who is eliairman,
Hon. Ilenriella M. Canty of
Atlanta. Hon. Gerald Johnson
of Carrollton, Hon. William
(Bill) Murray of Amerieus,
Hon. John Russell of Winder,
Hon. Janies R. Tuten, Jr. of
Brunswick and Representa-
lives Adams, Battle, Beek,
Burton. Karrh, Ramsey, Irvin,
and Bolster who are also
members of the Non-Resident
subeomniitlee.

Mous/e Members Meet on Campus Todutj
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Word
by Art Rogers

As editor of your paper. 1

am eurrently seeking out new

ways and ideas that will make
the Bent T ree more

appealing.
One of the first steps that

I am presenil) working on is
to get the Bent Tree

published in a more

newspaper type format. This
would probably include

printing on newsprint paper. 1

recently attended a Georgia
College Press Workshop and
not one college or junior
college represented there had

anything that even slightly
resembles the Bent Tree.

1 have heard a few

students express
dissatisfaction with the

present format that is used
and how “tacky” it looks. My
personal opinion is that I
couldn't agree more.

Therefore, 1 am presently
seeking bids from publishing
companies to print our paper
as we will have to have this
done off campus.

At this time the biggest
problem that I anticipate in

encountering will be to

convince the Student Affairs
Committee that this type of

printing will be worth the
extra funds that it will take
to accomplish making the
Bent Tree a better newspaper.

Secondly, 1 would also like
to seek out new ideas that
would help the Bent Tree
distribution problem. We are

presently only printing a

mere 1,000 copies and out of

that number only 500 are

reaching you, the students.
1 would welcome any

suggestions, comments, or

letters with ideas that you

may have to help solve these

problems. I ask that each and

every one of you please take
time to at least submit one

idea.

i'he editor welcomes your
letters and comments. Please

bring them by the Bent Tree
office in the rear of the
student lounge.

The Bent free

l-.ditor
As.soc. I'.ditor ....
News
Features
Sports
General I nterlaimnent
Distribution

Pholograpliy ....

I.KTTKRH TO THE EDITOR

lie.II I dilui Dear F.dilor,

I am willing in response
lo the Marathon Dance which
the SG.A sponsored for the
benefit ol the Heart Fund on

October 7 and X. I‘t? 7.
1 must honestly say that

the students and faculty who
did not attend the dance

really mis.serl out on a good
time. We had a fantastic disco

system ( I ha n ks to Art

Rogers), free food and cokes,
and plenty of ilanelng room.

We also IukI our own

comedian come in every
hour, and he was truly great
(thanks lo Rob I'aylor).

I he dancers were a fine

group of people. They
endureil a grueling 14 hours
to raise money for (he Heart
Fund, and I am sure that they
enjoyed it immensely. Too
bad more students rlid not

come and have a gooil time.
Much has been said about

the problem of student

apathy at Clayton Junior.

The .S(iA tried to have a

dance for the entire sliident

body, but there were not a

great deal of students there.

This could not have been lo a

lack of publicity, but was

more likely due to a lack of
interest on the part of the
student body.

Clayton Junior is your
school. I personally have just

begun to get invidved at

school, and it makes getting
up at 6 a.m a little easier,
and a lot more enjoyable.
Please take an interest in your
school and in all of (he
activities that are available to

you. .Any suggestions that

you might have should be
told to an .S(i,A member. Oui

job is to help the students,
and we enjoy doing our jcdi

Again, let me say ,i

personal thank-you lo the

participants and the workers
who attended the Marathon
Dance. It was really worth
the effort it took to raise the

.money for the Heart Fund

Sharon Wilkerson
SGA Ireasiirei

Dear Fditor,
I write this letter lo the

^
editor with a number of

questions in my mind. The
first is why is the turnout at

most of CJC’s dances so

small? The Orientation -

Marathon Da n c e h e I d
October 7th had between I Oil
and 115 people i n

attendance. Mils is

approximately of the
student enrollment at

Clayton Junior College this
(|iiarter. I'he dance held last

spring had only 1.J5 m

attendance at that. Not only
are these figures disheartening
to myself hut also raised
another question: Should
General F n t e r I a I n me n I

continue to spend money for
dances with this sort of poor
turnout'.’

. . . Art Rogers
Grady Anderson

. . Lynne Duieii

Kathy Kaiinii
. .Ciary Madia)
. . . rom Barr)
. James Cotton
Stewart l.iphatn
James Cottoti

Ranily Sinis

I personally hale lo see

the dan ces cancelled

altogether due to the fact (he
students in attendance at

these functions always seem

lo have a great lime. But does
the end justify the means? i

personally believe that there
should he fewer dances

riming the year but the
dances shouhl be held off

campus, in a place wliere
your favorite beverage is
■ivailable. File only dance that

has been held off campus
recently was the IdVb
( hristmas Ball and the
I u r no III for that was

approximately 725 people. I
do not attribute this entirely
I o I lie availability r)f
alchololic beverages but I
know- that it played a part in

helping attract the crowd.
file most important thing

I need from you. the stiulenl.
IS your input on this matter. I
have .1 mailbox in the Dean of
Sliulenis Office and I can

often he found in the SGA
Office 111 the Student Lounge.
I am generally on campus
from X a.m. until 2 p.m.
everyilay. I am anxious to

hear your i|uestions and your
answers lo these possible
problems.

James Jernigan
V'ice President Sti.A

School, as always, can be a

very frightening experience.
I'here are always so many
problems to contend with,
especially the problem of
making new friends. Usually,
though, everything turns out
for the best in the majority of
the situations.

Teachers. A very special
breed, if I may .say so myself.
I'hey are not just your
average run-of-the-mill
people. They always seem to
have extra courage, stamina,
and, unfortunately, that extra
streak of stuhbornness.

Some of us like to get
close in our relationships with
these special people. 1, for
one, have always gotten close
lo my teachers. In doing so, it
seems as though they are not

o n I y 1 e a c h i n g m e

academically, hut also

emotionally and mentally.
Because 1 am now only
beginning lo grow up, I need
their support in these areas,

anil, luckily. I always seem to

gel it.
Deans. An even more

special breed of person. I

always thought of them as

being so distant, so reserved.

So "st uck-un." Always so

official. A more accurate

IN BRIEF
1 wo days during the week

ol exams the bookstore will
he buying back used
textbooks at half of (he retail
price.

\ table will be set up
iiiskK' i he lIddîn ol flic
h o o k ^ I o r e for t h ose

interested in taking advantage
of this service.

Books with marks or

highlights will be accepted
and no receipt is necessary.

Signs will be posted
around campus lo inform
students of specific da) s and
lime the books can he sold.

Staff Reporters

.1 iilia \ imnghlood
I ricia Jeans
Patricia K.ine

(ligi Ilelion
Armenda Maxey
( lieryl ( arlei

Beth ( ira y
Denise Simmons

Views expressed in The Bent free
are those ot file Bent free staff or
Its contributors and are not

necessarily those of the
adminisiralion. I.iciilly, or student

body of Clay toil Junior Cidlege.
file Bent free is published
bi-monthly and luodiiced entirely
on the (laylon Junior College
campus under the direction of The
Bent free staff and its editors.

description would be that
they are honest, brilliant,
friendly, helpful, but even

more than anything else, they
are there. Where? There when
you have a question, or when
you need an explanation.

There when you want a bull
session, or when you are

depressed. There to dry your
tears, greet you with smiles,
and reprimand you for all the
offenses you commit. In
other words, they are simply
there when you need them.

Again, to help you
emotionally and mentally,
■fhen, why are they more

special than teachers?
Because they are not grading
your performance. They are

not questioning your
questions, and understanding,
which is the key to life.
Understanding. Such a special
breed of person. Very special.

Now can you see why 1
feel so special? 1 am one of
the people who can laugh
with, scream at, and be
scolded by a Dean.
Unemotional or not, his being
there s pells out one

extremely important thing:
he cares. What else could I
ask for?

Thoughts

by (irady Anderson

Last edition I mentioned

getting involved in your
school and its activities and
events. Activities that are

held strictly for you the
student, for your enjoyment
and entertainment. Getting
straight to the point I was

kind of dissapointed in the
lack of participation in the
Orientalion/Maralhon dance.
I would just like to tell you
that you missed an enjoyable
evening. The music was good
the snacks were delish and
the DJ was great. In short it
all added up to a great
evening.

The events that are slated
for the year here at ( JC are

payed for out of the Student

Activity fee money that you
the students have ahead)'
forked out. This money is
used to plan events that

hopefully will be acceptable
and enjoyable to the student.
I realize that many times it

may be impossible to attend
for certain eircumsta nces.

When an event is planned well
In advance though and

publicized then I can see no

reason for not attending at

least for a short while. T hese
events can he cancelled if the
students do not participate or

show interest. I feel that this
would be a shame and not

really an answer lo the

problem but it you I he
students would indicate to

the Bent Tree or the SGA
what your interests ate or

what you would like lo see

then something j'osilive could
be accomplished.
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This was a typical scene at the Wednesday Intramurals

photos by Stewart Lipham

Intramural Season Opens;
Vandals Defeat Huns ,7-6

By Gary Madray

Huns pass against the Vandals

SPORTS

In the season opener, held

October 5th, the Vandals
defeated the Huns by a score

of 7-6. The Vandals put up a

strong defensive stand and
had two touchdowns called
back. Quarterback Chris
Smith threw the touchdown
and extra point pass to his

same faithful end early in the

game to give the Vandals a

7-0 edge.
Late in the game. Smith

had a pass intercepted close

to the goal line. On the next

play, the Hun offense came

alive and made their first
touchdown of the season, but

the Vandals’ defense held on

the crucial extra point.

The Knights received a

serious blow in their game

against the Tribunes by losing
24-0. The Tribunes started
the blows early in the game
with an accurate aerial attack
on the poor, disorganized
Knight defense. Quarterback
Charlie (’antrell ran a smooth
offense throwing two

touchdown passes, running a

touchdown, and catching a

touchdown pass.
The Knight offense was

also hurt hy lack of

organization and experience
in playing flag football. In

fact, the offense never got off
the ground with the

exception of a couple of good
pass plays and one good run.

The result of this lack of

experience, was the Knights
being plagued by many

penalties.

Pete Gamma eludes a tackier

photo by James Cotton

Backpacking Class Takes a Hike

INTRAMURAL

STANDINGS

C.AMLS rODAY: 12:10 at

the Recreation I-ield

Knights vs Vandals
Huns vs I ribimes

INTRAMURAL I LAfi
FOOTBALL STANDINCiS

TFAM WON LOSS

Tribunes 2 0

Knights 1 1

Vandals I 1

Huns 0 2

^
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RECORD REVIEWD.J. Fever

by Rob Taylor
Director of Student Activities

The electronic digital
clock atop the disco system
control board ticked off the
seconds quickly. It was fast

approaching 8 p.m. Friday,
October 7th. This would be

the start of CJC’s one and

only 14 hour Marathon
Dance. Art Rogers, editor of
the Bent Tree, was also the
man chosen to provide the
music for this particular
activity. Art, representing the
J & R Sound Co. of Forest
Park (whoop-de-doo) had
been busy for over an hour

setting up his wide array of

equipment. All of us involved
with the Marathon Dance
were getting very excited.

Suddenly it was 8;00 and
Art blared through the

microphone “all right
dancers, on your feet.” There
were only three of the
Marathon Dancers there at

the beginning, Jenny O’Leary
(dancing solo except for
occasional partners) and
Penny Delano with her

partner Jon Felth. Little did
we know that these three
dancers would be the ones to

complete the entire fourteen
grueling hours.

My most exciting time

began at 10 till the hour each
hour of the dance. I got to
take over the microphone
with ten minutes of adlibs
that many people in the
audience really didn’t want to
hear. We gave away prizes
ranging from lunch for two at

a popular Atlanta restaurant
to a fifty piece flatware

setting from Zales Jewelers at
Southlake.

During the second set

Carla Knowles and Jennifer
Morgan, the other two

students signed up for the
Marathon Dance arrived and

began to boogie. Carla
continued through midnight
and Jennifer lasted the

remaining 121/2 hours of the
Marathon.

Zimmerman
Gives
Concert
By GiGi Helton

Elena Zimmerman,
coordinator of English at

CJC, presented a splendid
piano recital here recently
which was enjoyed by many
students and faculty
members.

The audience listened
enthusiastically as Ms.
Zimmerman played selected
numbers from Ludwig van

Beethoven, Frederic Chopin
and Claude Debussy. A

unique version of
Yankeedoodle as composed
by Anthony Philip Heinrich
and Union!, a blatantly
patriotic piece by Louise
Moreau Gottschalk, were also
on the program.
Elena Zimmerman

received her Bachelor of
Music from Converse College
as well as her Masters degree,
majoring in piano. She

completed her Ph.D. at the

University of Tennessee in

English.

As my time on the

microphone came near each
hour I felt the excitement rise
within me. Here was my

chance, I too could be Gary
McKee, Willis the Guard,
Chase or Woodside. My
particular style was a blend of
all four plus other extraneous
bits.

We continued to offer
exciting prizes from the CJC
Prize Depository. These
included rolls of toilet tissue,
a CJC coffee kit (2 styrofoam
cups, a stirrer and pack of
cremora) and even an exciting
CJC information pack.

During the evening many
exciting things happened such
as a visit by the Clayton
County Sheriff’s Department.
We initially thought they
were coming in with a noise

complaint but instead they
came in to donate $28.00
that they had collected from
other deputies and from the
C & S Bank of Jonesboro.
This did a lot to boost the
spirits of the remaining
Marathon Dancers.
At approximately_9:15 in

the a.m. the Chick-Til-A
Chicken, in full feathers,
came in and became Jenny
O’Leary’s partner for two

dances. Surely this was the

highlight of her evening.
I was lucky enough to get

a few hours of sleep between
1 and 6 and return to the
dance dressed in a tuxedo
which further encouraged the
dancers to new heights of

energy and excitement.

Through out the evening
over 100 students, faculty
and administrators dropped
in to dance with and give
encouragement to the
Marathon Dancers who, if

they are able to collect all of
their pledges will have raised
over $500.00 for the Clayton
County Heart Fund.

Naturally, we appreciate
everybody’s effort in

supporting this Marathon
Dance.

Harrowen
and

Callaway
Give Recital

Gigi Helton

Peter Harrower, professor
of Music at Georgia State
University, and Irene

Callaway, a noted soprano,
entertained an enthusiastic
house here at CJC on October
11 in a joint vocal recital.

The joint recitalists
performed numerous songs of
which many had a religious
reference. The program
included selected numbers
from The Creation by Franz
Joseph Haydn, Vier Ernsto
Gesange and Dûtes Opus 66
and Opus 20 by Johannes

Brahms, Elizah by Fleix

Mendelssohn, Gloria by Ned

Rorem, Hermit Songs by
Samuel Barben and Old
American Songs as arranged
by Aaron Copland.

In response to the

standing ovation Mr.
Harrower and Miss Callaway
did as an encore, the Copland
arrangement of The Lone
Wild Bird .

Accompanying the couple
on the piano was Jeannine
Morrison, assistant professor
of Music here at CJC. Her
talents on the piano
contributed to the success of
the evening.

Both Mr. Harrower and
Miss Callaway are noted for
their splendid performances
at home as well as abroad.
They have performed with
the Philadelphia Orchestra
under the direction of Eugene
Ormandy, the Lyric Opera of
Chicago and have had many
engagements in Europe.

By Randy Sims

Over the years Styx has

suffered a number of
setbacks. Keeping them out

of the eyes or ears of the

public. Wooden Nickel

Records, a small Chicago
based company, can be
blamed for poor management
and minor promotion, in

addition an almost total lack
of attention came from both
the press and radio

programmers. The Grand
Illusion their third and latest
A&M release, is climbing the

charts. The personnel of Styx
consists of Dennis Deyoung
(keyboards/vocals), who has
broadened his keyboard
spectrum on this album,
James Young (guitar/vocal).

Tommy Shaw (guitar/vocal).
Chuck Panozzo (bass) and
John Panozzo (drums).
Within The Grand

Illusion , the Styx style is

fully developed. A style
madeup of classically
influenced kayboard themes,
thundering rock and roll

guitars, sensitive lyrics and

strong lead and harmony
vocals. The song writers of

Styx reveal their own identity
with Tommy Shaw’s “Man In
the Wilderness,’’ James

Young’s rock and roller,
“Miss America,” and Dennis
Deyoung’s romantic “Come
Sail Away.”

Unlike many bands, Styx
is equally as good live as they
are on album. Styx is
expected to play Atlanta
December 1.

Calender Off Evenffe

Oct. 19 Sarah Martin Lecture
Oct. 19 Lecture on Sex Crimes - Walter McLaughlin
Oct. 21 Opera “The Mikado”
Oct. 25 Lecture “Advertising and Free Enterprise”

Alex Bealer
Oct. 26 CJC Student Recital
Oct. 26 Facultv/Student Poetry Reading
Oct. 27 Faculty/Student Poetry Reading
Oct. 28 Movie “Marathon Man”

Kiddie Film “Tales ofWashington Irving”
Oct. 29 SGA Halloween Party for Underprivileged Children

Nov. 2 George Petsch Guitar Recital
Nov. 3 Irma McLaurin - Poetry Reading
Nov. 4 General Entertainment Concert
Nov. 9 CJC Choir in Concert
Nov. 11 Movie “Let’s Do It Again”

Kiddie Film “Treasure Island Revisited”
Nov. 15 Eugene Martin Piano Recital
Nov. 16 CJC Band in Concert
Nov. 17 Lecture “Free Enterprise and the New Corporate Leaders”

Michael Maccoby
. Nov. 1 8 Drama Production
Nov. 23 CJC Ensembles in Concert
Nov.-29 CJC Students in Recital

Nov. 30 CJC Students in Recital
Dec. 2 Movie “Rocky”

Kiddie Film “A Boy Named Charlie Brown”
Dec. 8 Christmas Ball
Dec. 9 Christmas Dinner/Musical “Song of Herod”

A thriller
Paramount Pictures presents

a ROBERT EVANS-SIDNEY BECKERMAN production

a JOHN SCHLESINCER «un

DUSTIN HOFFMAN
LAURENCE OUVIER ROYSCHEIDER
WnUAM DEVANE MARTHE KELLERi.

"MARATHON MAN'
screenplay byWILLIAM GOLDMAN from his novel

producM by ROBERT EVANS and SIDNEY BECKERMAN
directed by JOHN SCHLESINCER music scored bymichaei small

RAftTMCTie services by CONNAUCHT PRODUCTIONS kiCoior a paramount
Pf.id rtieoei'piitTerDack picture

1:15,6:30, 8:30, & lO CO

The Town of Titipu

Book by

W. S. GILBERT

Musk hy

ARTHUR SULLIVAN

Authtntxc t'frmn
EJtrtd by

BRYCESON TREHARNE

Tk\f uoTf conUitnj all the diaheuf.

(4. IA24

(^'cheslrn ntalfruil may be rented

from the Publtshen.

G. SCHIRMER
New York/London

8:00 P.M.

October 21 and 22 G-132


